Bowling Green State University

PLANS BY: StructureTec Group

BIDS OPENED AND

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATED BY: Beth Q. Magel

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

OPENING DATE & TIME: <u>6/4/2012 at 3:30 p.m.</u>

RE- BID #5781

PROJECT: 2012 Masonry Restoration

PUBLISHED:

\$545,000.00 **General Base Bid**

\$94,000.00 **Alternates**

TOTAL \$639,000.00

	Trisco	Brien Bros.	Ram Const.	Cusacks Masonry		
Addendum #1, #2	i	~				
Bond	<i>i</i> /					
·						
Item #1 - General Trades Base Bid (lead)						
Hanna Hall	43,361.00	no bid	38,000.00	41,750.00	,	
Alternate 1A Moseley Hall	25,883.00	no bid	28,000.00	31,600.00		
Alternate 1B - Eppler North Bldg.	8,807.00	no bid	18,500.00	20,500.00		
Alternate 1C-Family & Consumer Sci.	19,486.00	no bid	18,400.00	24,100.00		
Alternate 1D-Shatzel Hall	22,201.00	no bid	22,600.00	26,450.00		
General Trades Base Bid 2-						
Technology Bldg	176,218.00	222,900.00	177,500.00	198,800-00		
		·				
General Trades Base Bid 3 -						
Moore Music Center	188,335.00	no bid	236,000.00	220,750.00		
	Loce Volue	<u></u>				