

PLANS BY: Technicon Design Group, Inc.

BGSU

Bowling Green State University

BID# 5774

BIDS OPENED AND
READ BY: Beth A. Nagel *Beth A. Nagel*

PROJECT: FY12 Roof Repair / Masonry Point Project

BID TABULATED BY: GARY LINGERER
Gary Lingerer

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PUBLISHED: General Trades: \$ 970,750.00
Alternatives: \$ 362,000.00

Total: \$ 1,332,750.00

OPENING DATE & TIME: April 26, 2012 @ 3:30 p.m.

Description:	NORDMANN	ADVANCED	QUALITY	WOLFE'S	UNITED	CRM	
Addendum # 1	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	
Bond	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	
Item #1 101 - Huntington Building	\$ 305,000.00	\$ 295,000.00	\$ 318,000.00	\$ 325,041.00	\$ 398,400.00	\$ 397,280.00	
				\$ 277,149.00			
Item #2 102 - University Hall	\$ 328,915.00	\$ 438,000.00	\$ 239,250.00	\$ 227 ←	\$ 397,800.00	\$ No Bid	
Alt. G-1 Psychology Building	\$ 285,000.00	\$ 261,000.00	\$ 240,350.00	\$ 252,289.00	\$ 245,000.00	No Bid	
Item #3 103 - Architectural Studio	\$ 78,500.00	\$ 93,214.00	\$ 118,600.00	\$ 96,111.00	\$ 129,200.00	No Bid	
Alt. G-2 Moore Musical Arts Center	\$ 65,785.00	\$ 59,391.00	\$ 86,400.00	\$ 84,172.00	\$ 89,700.00	No Bid	
Alt. G-3 Eppler Building	\$ 34,000.00	\$ 31,883.00	\$ 34,800.00	\$ 20,163.00	\$ 39,200.00	No Bid	

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.

Ohio Department of Administrative Services, Standard Conditions of Contract for Construction, p. 00 21 13 -11

BGSU - Jim Brown

