

*WKS*  
*Beck*

PLANS BY: Bostwick Design Partnership

BID #5366

BIDS OPENED AND



Bowling Green State University

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PROJECT: Lot 5 & Lot 12 Expansion

BID TABULATED BY: RICH GRIMMEYER, S.P.P.

OPENING DATE & TIME: 4/23/2009 2:00 p.m.

PUBLISHED:

General Base Bid \$2,314,000.00  
Alternates \$940,000.00  
TOTAL \$3,254,000.00

		SHELLY	DIVERSIFIED	CRESTLINE	BOWERS	VERNON & NAGEL	MCCONNELL	MILNER BROS
Addendum #1, #2		✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Bond		✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Item #1 - General Trades (Lead) Contract								
*Unit Price GR1 Rock Removal 125 Cu. Yd.		135.00	150.00	165.00	175.00	350.00	75.00	300.00
Extension Rock Removal		16,875.00	18,750	20,625	21,875	43,750	9,375.00	37,500
*Unsuitable Sub. Replace 100 cu. Yd.		4950	30.00	43.00	25.00	42.00	45.00	29.70
Extension Unsuitable Sub. Replace		4,950.00	3,000	4,300	2,500	4,200	4,500	2,970
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions		21,825	21,750	24,925	24,375	47,950	13,875	40,470
General Trades Contract Base Bid(+GR1)		1,646,875	1,593,725	1,674,624	1,528,000	1,790,000	1,671,527	1,378,000
Alternate G-1 (add) N. area asphalt		299,500	298,810	350,272	274,400	400,000	325,501	278,000
Alternate G-2 (add) N. area gravel		188,500	179,769	217,241	148,000	250,000	185,793	139,500
Alternate G-3 (add) concrete sidewalk		64,000	49,759	71,400	59,900	75,000	71,091	57,000
Item #2 Electrical Contract		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
*Unit Price ER1 Rock Removal 30 cu. Yd.								
Extension Rock Removal								
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions								
Electrical Contract Base Bid (+ER1)								
Alternate E-1 poles & luminaires N. Prk.								
Alternate E-2 fiberglass tapered poles								
*Unit Price is per Cubic Yard								

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.  
Ohio Department of Administrative Services, Standard Conditions of Contract for Construction, p. 00 21 13 -11

PLANS BY: Bostwick Design Partnership

BIDS OPENED AND

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATED BY: RICH OPTMEYER, B.O.P.

BID #5366



BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PROJECT: Lot 5 & Lot 12 Expansion

PUBLISHED:

OPENING DATE & TIME: 4/23/2009 2:00 p.m.

General Base Bid \$2,314,000.00  
Alternates \$940,000.00

TOTAL \$3,254,000.00

SHEW						
	NO BID	DIVERSIFIED	CASTLINE	BOWERS	VERNON & NAGEL	McINNIS
Item #3 Combined Contract						
Unit Price GR1 Rock Removal 125 cu. Yd.	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Extension Rock Removal						
Unsuitable Sub. Replace 100 cu. Yd.						
Extension Unsuitable Sub. Replace						
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions						
Unit Price ER1 Rock Removal 30 cu. Yd.						
Extension Rock Removal						
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions						
Combined Contract Base Bid						
Alternate G-1 (add) N. area asphalt						
Alternate G-2 (add) N. area gravel						
Alternate G-3 (add) concrete sidewalk						
Alternate E-1 poles & luminaires N. Prk.						
Alternate E-2 fiberglass tapered poles	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.

Ohio Department of Administrative Services, Standard Conditions of Contract for Construction, p. 00 21 13 -11



PLANS BY: Bostwick Design Partnership

BID #5366

Bowling Green State University

BIDS OPENED AND

PROJECT: Lot 5 & Lot 12 Expansion

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PUBLISHED:

BID TABULATED BY: RICH DETMEYER, B.D.P.

OPENING DATE & TIME: 4/23/2009 2:00 p.m.

General Base Bid \$2,314,000.00  
Alternates \$940,000.00  
TOTAL \$3,254,000.00

Addendum #1, #2	ANDERZACK	NORTHWEST	ROMANOFF	RECENT	COLGATE-DANIS	LAIBE	LAKE ERIE
Bond	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Item #1 - General Trades (Lead) Contract		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
*Unit Price GR1 Rock Removal 125 Cu. Yd.	450.00						
Extension Rock Removal	56,250.						
*Unsuitable Sub. Replace 100 cu. Yd.	42.00						
Extension Unsuitable Sub. Replace	4,200						
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions	60,450						
General Trades Contract Base Bid(+GR1)	1,512,000						
Alternate G-1 (add) N. area asphalt	286,000						
Alternate G-2 (add) N. area gravel	158,000						
Alternate G-3 (add) concrete sidewalk	60,000	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Item #2 Electrical Contract	NO BID						
*Unit Price ER1 Rock Removal 30 cu. Yd.		395.00	394.00	285.00	390.00	460.00	1,050.00
Extension Rock Removal		11,850	11,820	8,550	11,700	13,500	31,500
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions		11,850	11,820	8,550	11,700	13,500	31,500
Electrical Contract Base Bid (+ER1)		198,372	183,500	221,745	234,187	233,780	228,855
Alternate E-1 poles & luminaires N. Prk.		17,998	11,800	28,255	26,998	25,780	24,860
Alternate E-2 fiberglass tapered poles		14,038	24,000	(3,000)	7,740	10,400	4,750
*Unit Price is per Cubic Yard							

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.  
Ohio Department of Administrative Services, Standard Conditions of Contract for Construction, p. 00 21 13 -11

PLANS BY: Bostwick Design Partnership

BIDS OPENED AND

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATED BY: ROT ORTMAYER, B.D.P.



Bowling Green State University

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PROJECT: Lot 5 & Lot 12 Expansion

BID #53366

PUBLISHED:

OPENING DATE & TIME: 4/23/2009 2:00 p.m.

General Base Bid \$2,314,000.00  
Alternates \$940,000.00

TOTAL \$3,254,000.00

	ANDERZACK	NORTHWEST	EDMANOFF	REGENT	COLGAN-DAVIS	LAHSE	LAKE ERIE
Item #3 Combined Contract	NO BID				NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Unit Price GR1 Rock Removal 125 cu. Yd.							
Extension Rock Removal							
Unsuitable Sub. Replace 100 cu. Yd.							
Extension Unsuitable Sub. Replace							
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions							
Unit Price ER1 Rock Removal 30 cu. Yd.							
Extension Rock Removal							
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions							
Combined Contract Base Bid							
Alternate G-1 (add) N. area asphalt							
Alternate G-2 (add) N. area gravel							
Alternate G-3 (add) concrete sidewalk							
Alternate E-1 poles & luminaires N. Prk.							
Alternate E-2 fiberglass tapered poles							

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.



PLANS BY: Bostwick Design Partnership

BID #5366

BIDS OPENED AND

Bowling Green State University

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PROJECT: Lot 5 & Lot 12 Expansion

BID TABULATED BY: ROD ORTMAYER, B.D.P.

OPENING DATE & TIME: 4/23/2009 2:00 p.m.

PUBLISHED:

General Base Bid \$2,314,000.00  
Alternates \$940,000.00  
TOTAL \$3,254,000.00

	BRNT	SCMCK						
Addendum #1, #2	✓	✓						
Bond	✓	LETTER OF CREDIT						
Item #1 - General Trades (Lead) Contract	NO BID	NO BID						
*Unit Price GR1 Rock Removal 125 Cu. Yd.								
Extension Rock Removal								
*Unsuitable Sub. Replace 100 cu. Yd.								
Extension Unsuitable Sub. Replace								
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions								
General Trades Contract Base Bid(+GR1)								
Alternate G-1 (add) N. area asphalt								
Alternate G-2 (add) N. area gravel								
Alternate G-3 (add) concrete sidewalk	↓	↓						
Item #2 Electrical Contract								
*Unit Price ER1 Rock Removal 30 cu. Yd.	150.00	125.00						
Extension Rock Removal	4,500	3,750						
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions	4,500	3,750						
Electrical Contract Base Bid (+ER1)	207,200	213,500						
Alternate E-1 poles & luminaires N. Pk.	24,200	26,600						
Alternate E-2 fiberglass tapered poles	12,000	11,400						

\*Unit Price is per Cubic Yard

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.

PLANS BY: Bostwick Design Partnership

BIDS OPENED AND

READ BY: Beth Nagel, Assistant Director of Purchasing

BID TABULATED BY: Rich Oetmeyer, B.O.P.



Bowling Green State University

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PUBLISHED:

PROJECT: Lot 5 & Lot 12 Expansion

BID #5366

OPENING DATE & TIME: 4/23/2009 2:00 p.m.

General Base Bid \$2,314,000.00  
Alternates \$940,000.00

TOTAL \$3,254,000.00

Item #3 Combined Contract	BRINT	SOCKL							
Unit Price GR1 Rock Removal 125 cu. Yd.	NO BID	NO BID							
Extension Rock Removal									
Unsuitable Sub. Replace 100 cu. Yd.									
Extension Unsuitable Sub. Replace									
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions									
Unit Price ER1 Rock Removal 30 cu. Yd.									
Extension Rock Removal									
Subtotal of Unit Price Extensions									
Combined Contract Base Bid									
Alternate G-1 (add) N. area asphalt									
Alternate G-2 (add) N. area gravel									
Alternate G-3 (add) concrete sidewalk									
Alternate E-1 poles & luminaires N. Prk.									
Alternate E-2 fiberglass tapered poles									

The public opening and reading of bids is for informational purposes only and is not to be construed as an acceptance or rejection of any bid submitted.