BID# 5252

PLANS BY: BGSU Office of Design and Construction BIDS OPENED AND READ BY: __Beth A. Nagel____ ALL O May

BID TABULATED BY: HENCE HUCK

CONTRACT:

PROJECT: 316 West Building, Office Renovation-Firelands

OPENING DATE & TIME: 3/21/08 2:00 p.m.

PUBISHED: General \$30,000.00
HVAC \$10000.00
Electrical \$11500.00
TOTAL \$51,500.00

	·					_	
Bond	18thox of Badit						<
EEO		NO		Y	No	_	から
Worker's Comp.		1		NO	, vo	8/	No
Responsible Bidder form		^					, i
Drug Free Workplace Cert.		7		1		1	
Item #1 General Contract (lead)	29 155.00	30,468.00	27,600.00	32 300.00	29 346 00	2005	NO 61 17
Alternate G-1 add to base	7,180.00	5,950.00	5,900.00	8,800.00	5,420.00		
Item #2 Mechanical Contract	N/A	NOB, P	NO BID		No BID	15,100.00	9,805.00
Alternate M-1 add to base	N/A					900.00	625.00
Item #3 Electrical Contract	N/A	NO BID	NO BID		NOBID	NO BID	018 ON
Alternate E-1 add to base	N/A						
Item #4 Combined Contract	WA	018 ON	NOBID		OB ON	NUBID	NOBID
Item #1, #2, #3							
Combined Alternate							
G-1, M-1, E-1							
						The state of the s	

BID# 5252

BID TABULATION - Purchasing Department

PLANS BY: BGSU Office of Design and Construction BIDS OPENED AND READ BY: Beth A. Nagel Buth Magnet

BID TABULATED BY: KONE HUEN faculoasing

CONTRACT:

PROJECT: 316 West Building, Office Renovation-Firelands

PUBISHED: General \$30,000.00
HVAC \$10000.00
Electrical \$ 11500.00
TOTAL \$51,500.00

OPENING DATE & TIME: 3/21/08 2:00 p.m.